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16. I t must not be forgotten, moreover, that at present about one-fourth 
of the export trade of this country consists of foreign and colonial produce, 
and that the imposition of duties on foreign produce would involve an enor­
mous immediate outlay for the extension of bonding facilities, and the 
necessary charges for their use and maintenance. The result would be to 
place such obstacles in the way of this trade that its transference elsewhere 
would speedily take place, goods which this country now receives for re­
export being sent direct to their market, or through some other entrepdt 
where they would not be subjected to such disabilities. Thus the position 
of this country as the great market of the world, already threatened, would 
be destroyed. 

17. These changes could not fail to seriously injure our important carrying 
trade and to react injuriously on every industry in the United Kingdom. 

18. On the other hand the gain to the Colonies, whatever it might be, 
would, even at first, be altogether incommensurate with the loss to the 
Mother Country. And it is improbable that there would be any permanent 
gain, for, apart from the general loss of purchasing power due to the fall in 
wages and profits resulting from the imposition of duties, it is obvious that 
the reduction of our imports from foreign countries would be followed by a 
reduction in our exports to them, no inconsiderable part of which consists 
of colonial produce imported in a crude state and more or less manufactured 
in this country. The demand, therefore, for colonial produce, even with 
the preferential advantage proposed to be allowed to it, would not be likely 
to increase, and the price obtained for it would, therefore, not be ultimate­
ly enhanced. 

19. If the differentiation is to be confined to some specified articles, the 
difficulties of arriving at an equitable arrangement would be in no way 
diminished. Some of these difficulties were clearly pointed out by the 
representatives of New South Wales, Queensland and New Zealand, in the 
course of the discussion, and no practical standard was suggested by which 
the value of the concessions to be made on each side could be tried or ad­
justed. These would obviously vary according to the number of colonies 
sharing in the arrangement and many other circumstances, and, as the 
people of this country and those of the Colonies would approach the con­
sideration of the question from entirely different points of view, a satisfac­
tory agreement would seem almost impossible. To this country it would 
mean a possible increase of revenue for a period, but at the same time a 
serious curtailment of trade, with loss of employment and enhance 1 price 
of food and other necessaries, and it would, in the main, be judged by its 
effect on our commerce and on the condition of the people. 

JO. To the Colonies, on the other hand, it would in the first instance 
mainly present itself as a question of revenue. A remission of duty on 
the bulk of their imports would involve an entire readjustment of their 
fiscal system, requiring the resort to increased direct taxation or other 
means, and though there might be at first an increase in the price of their 
produce imported into this country, the revenue difficulty would probably 
appeal to them most strongly. 

21. A consideration of these practical difficulties, and of the more imme­
diate results above indicated, of a system of mutual tariff discrimination, 
has convinced Her Majesty's Government that, even if its consequences were 


